
THE  MICRO,  SMALL  AND  MEDIUM  ENTERPRISES
DEVELOPMENT (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015

A

BILL

to amend the Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises Development Act, 2006.

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises Development
(Amendment) Act, 2015.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. In the Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises Development Act, 2006 (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act), in section 7,—

(a) in sub-section (1),–

Short title and
commencement.

27 of 2006.

Bill No.  85 of  2015

TO BE INTRODUCED IN LOK SABHA

A m e n d m e n t
of section 7.

5



2

(i) in clause (a),—

(A) in sub-clause (i), for the words “twenty-five lakh  rupees”, the
words “fifty lakh rupees” shall be substituted;

(B) for sub-clauses (ii) and (iii), the following sub-clauses shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(ii) a small enterprise, where the investment in plant and
machinery is more than fifty lakh rupees but does not exceed ten
crore rupees;

(iii) a medium enterprise, where the investment in plant and
machinery is more than ten crore rupees but does not exceed thirty
crore rupees;”;

(ii) in clause (b),—

(A) in sub-clause (i), for the words “ten lakh rupees”, the words
“twenty lakh rupees” shall be substituted;

(B) for sub-clauses (ii) and (iii), the following sub-clauses shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(ii) a small enterprise, where the investment in equipment is
more than twenty lakh rupees but does not exceed five crore
rupees;

(iii) a medium enterprise, where the investment in equipment
is more than five crore rupees but does not exceed fifteen crore
rupees;”;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be  inserted, namely:—

“(1A) The Central Government may, by notification, vary the investment
limits, which shall not exceed thrice the limits, specified in clauses (a) and (b) of
sub-section (1) for the purposes of development of micro, small and medium
enterprises.”;

(c) in sub-section (9),—

(i) for the words “criterion of investment”, the words “criterion of higher
investment” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words “as part of small enterprises”, the words “as part of small
and medium enterprises” shall be substituted.

3. In the principal Act, in section 29, in sub-section (3), for the words and figure “under
section 9”, the words, brackets, figures and letter “under sub-section (1A) of section 7,
section 9” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 29.

5

10

15

25

20

30

35



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises Development (MSMED) Act, 2006 was
enacted to address policy issues affecting MSMEs as well as to classify the enterprises as
micro, small or medium based on their investments in plant and machinery/equipments. The
existing limits under the MSMED Act were fixed in 2006. Since then, there has been a
significant increase in the price index and cost of inputs. There has also been a change in the
business environment with many MSMEs becoming part of the domestic and global value
chains. Hence, it is proposed to amend the MSMED Act to enhance the existing limit for
investment in plant and machinery considering changes in price index and cost of inputs
consistent with the emerging role of the MSMEs in various global value chains.

2. The MSMED Act, at present, states that the Central Government may, while
classifying any class or classes of enterprises, vary, from time to time, the criterion of investment
and also consider criteria or standards in respect of employment or turnover of the enterprises.
These provisions enable the Central Government to classify micro or tiny enterprises or the
village enterprises as part of small enterprises. The current proposal is to enable Central
Government to classify micro or tiny enterprises or the village enterprises not only as small
enterprises but also as medium enterprises. This may also be based on criteria of higher
investment and also on consideration of criteria or standard in respect of employment or
turnover of the enterprises. It will open the doors of growth to MSMEs and will enable them
to go to next level of value chain.

3. Since the MSMEs are defined in the Act, any variation could be done only by way
of an amendment. Considering the inflation and dynamic market situation, there is a need to
periodically revise the criterion of investment. Revising the investment limits by way of
notification will facilitate timely action. Hence, it is proposed to amend the MSMED Act to
empower  Central Government to vary by way of a notification, the investment limits,
which shall not exceed thrice the limits, specified in clauses (a) and (b) of sub-section (1) of
section 7 for the purposes of development of micro, small and medium enterprises.

4. The Bill seeks to achieve the above objects.

NEW DELHI; KALRAJ  MISHRA
The 18th   March, 2015.

3



MEMORANDUM  REGARDING  DELEGATED  LEGISLATION

Sub-clause (b) of clause 2 of the Bill seeks to insert sub-section (1A) in section 7 of the
Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises Development Act, 2006, so as to empower the Central
Government to vary the investment limits relating to the classification of micro, small and
medium enterprises by way of notification.

2. The matters in respect of which rules may be made under the proposed legislature
are matters of procedure or administrative details and it is not practicable to provide for them
in the Bill itself. The delegation of legislative power is, therefore, of a normal character.

4



ANNEXURE

EXTRACTS FROM THE MICRO, SMALL AND MEDIUM ENTERPRISES DEVELOPMENT ACT, 2006

(27 OF 2006)

* * * * *

CHAPTER III

CLASSIFICATION OF ENTERPRISES, ADVISORY COMMITTEE AND MEMORANDUM OF MICRO, SMALL AND

MEDIUM ENTERPRISES

7. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 11B of the Industries
(Development and Regulation) Act, 1951, the Central Government may, for the purposes of
this Act, by notification and having regard to the provisions of sub-sections (4) and (5),
classify any class or classes of enterprises, whether proprietorship, Hindu undivided family,
association of persons, co-operative society, partnership firm, company or undertaking, by
whatever name called,—

(a) in the case of the enterprises engaged in the manufacture or production of
goods pertaining to any industry specified in the First Schedule to the Industries
(Development and Regulation) Act, 1951,  as—

(i) a micro enterprise, where the investment in plant and machinery does
not exceed twenty-five lakh rupees;

(ii) a small enterprise, where the investment in plant and machinery is more
than twenty-five lakh rupees but does not exceed five crore rupees; or

(iii) a medium enterprise, where the investment in plant and machinery is
more than five crore rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;

(b) in the case of the enterprises engaged in providing or rendering of services,
as—

(i) a micro enterprise, where the investment in equipment does not exceed
ten lakh rupees;

(ii) a small enterprise, where the investment in equipment is more than ten
lakh rupees but does not exceed two crore rupees; or

(iii) a medium enterprise, where the investment in equipment is more than
two crore rupees but does not exceed five crore rupees.

Explanation 1.— For the removal of doubts, it is hereby clarified that in calculating the
investment in plant and machinery, the cost of pollution control, research and development,
industrial safety devices and such other items as may be specified, by notification, shall be
excluded.

Explanation 2.— It is clarified that the provisions of section 29B of the Industries
(Development and Regulation) Act, 1951, shall be applicable to the enterprises specified in
sub-clauses (i) and (ii) of clause (a) of sub-section (I) of this section.

* * * * *

(9) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 11B of the Industries (Development
and Regulation) Act, 1951  and clause (h) of section 2 of the Khadi  and Village Industries
Commission Act, 1956, the Central Government may, while classifying any class or classes  of
enterprises under sub-section (1), vary, from time to time, the criterion of investment and also

Classification
of enterprises.

5

65 of 1951.

65 of 1951.
61 of 1956.

65 of 1951.

65 of 1951.



6

consider criteria or standards in respect of employment or turnover of the enterprises and
include in such classification the micro or tiny enterprises or the village enterprises, as part
of small enterprises.

* * * * *

29. (1)* * * * *

(3) Every notification issued under section 9 and every rule  made by the Central
Government under this section shall be laid, as soon as may be after it is made, before  each
House of Parliament, while it is in session, for a total period of thirty days which may be
comprised in one session or in two or more successive sessions, and if, before the expiry of
the session immediately following the session or the successive sessions aforesaid, both
Houses agree in making any modification in the notification or rule or both Houses agree that
the notification or rule should not be made, the notification or rule shall thereafter have effect
only in such modified form or be of no effect, as the case may be; so, however, that any such
modification or annulment shall be without prejudice to the validity of anything previously
done under that notification or rule.

* * * * *

Power to make
rules.



LOK  SABHA

————

A

BILL

to amend the Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises Development Act, 2006.

————

(Shri Kalraj Mishra, Minister of Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises)

GMGIPMRND—5601LS(E)—27-03-2015.



LOK SABHA 

------  

 

CORRIGENDUM 

 

to  

 

THE MICRO, SMALL AND MEDIUM  ENTERPRISES DEVELOPMENT (AMENDMENT) 

BILL, 2015 

 

[To be/As introduced in Lok Sabha]  
 

 

1.  Page 3, in line 4 of paragraph No. 2,- 

 

 for     “enable the Central Government” 

 

read   “enable Central Government”. 

 

 

 

         NEW DELHI; 

 

April 13, 2015 ______           

Chaitra 23, 1937 (Saka) 

 

 

 


	MSME bill, 2015.pdf
	Corr_MSME.pdf


<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /All
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Warning
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000500044004600206587686353ef901a8fc7684c976262535370673a548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200208fdb884c9ad88d2891cf62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef653ef5728684c9762537088686a5f548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200204e0a73725f979ad854c18cea7684521753706548679c300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020b370c2a4d06cd0d10020d504b9b0d1300020bc0f0020ad50c815ae30c5d0c11c0020ace0d488c9c8b85c0020c778c1c4d560002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken voor kwaliteitsafdrukken op desktopprinters en proofers. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents for quality printing on desktop printers and proofers.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /NoConversion
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /NA
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure true
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles true
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /NA
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


